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Statement of Line

Features

Optional Tapered StyleOptional Plinth Base

ventiseri
Occasional Tables

Kwalu’s Ventiseri Collection incorporates modern lines, 

giving a sleek and finished feel to these Italian-inspired 

cube tables. Contemporary in style, these rectangular 

occasional tables can be used as coffee tables and/

or side tables and are available in three sizes and two 

heights. The optional plinth base creates a more defined 

base. A black or white standard or hospital grade round 

recessed power module is available and is optional. Model: VENTBL32AE2

TBLVENTF0521

Optional Plinth base is 
available for straight 
base only.

Choose from 2 base 
styles – Tapered, which 
is optional and Straight.

VENTBL32BA1G1 
48W  24D  22H

VENTBL22AA1 
20W  30D  22H

VENTBL31AE1G1 
48W  24D  18H

VENTBL32AA2G1 
48W  24D  22H

VENTBL12AE2 
20W  24D  22H

VENTBL31AA1 
48W  24D  18H

VENTBL12AA1 
20W  24D  22H

VENTBL21BA1 
20W  30D  18H

*To see additional versions of this collection go to 
www.kwalu.com/product/ventiseri-end-table

Optional Kwalu Top
Available with a top 
made of Kwalu's 
proprietary material.

Corian®/ Hanex®/ Krion® 
Top
Corian®/ Hanex®/ Krion® 
tops are available for 
Ventiseri End Tables 
except size 20"W x 30"D 
x 22"H.

Optional Power Module
Optional round recessed 
power module, featuring 
a power plug and two 
USB ports, is available in 
both standard and hos-
pital grade. The module 
finish is offered in black 
or white, is positioned 
in the center of coffee 
tables and near the edge 
of end tables.

48W    24D    22H

Durable Finish
Kwalu's proprietary finish 
doesn't have any of the 
drawbacks of wood. The 
finish is moisture imper-
vious, easy to clean and 
maintenance-free.

http://www.kwalu.com/product/ventiseri-end-table

